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DEOD SUMMARY 
 

PEST AND BIRD CONTROL SERVICES / OP4850520008370 
 
 

A. Small Business Participation  
 

The Diversity and Economic Opportunity Department (DEOD) established a 10% 
Small Business Enterprise (SBE) and 3% Disabled Veteran Business Enterprise 
(DVBE) goal for this Medium Size Business Enterprise (MSZ-I) solicitation.  CDS 
Services Inc., DBA Legion Pest Management, an SBE and DVBE firm, exceeded the 
goal by making a 60% SBE and 40% DVBE commitment. 
 

Small Business 

Goal 

10% SBE 
3% DVBE 

Small Business 

Commitment 

60% SBE 
40% DVBE 

 

 SBE Subcontractor % Committed LSBE Non-LSBE 

1. CDS Services Inc., 
DBA Legion Pest 
Management (Prime) 

60%  X 

 Total Commitment 60%   

 

 DVBE Subcontractor % Committed LSBE Non-LSBE 

1. CDS Services Inc., 
DBA Legion Pest 
Management (Prime) 

40%  X 

 Total Commitment 40%   

 
 
B. Medium Size Business Enterprise Program (MSZ-I) 
 

CDS Services Inc., DBA Legion Pest Management is an MSZ-I firm. 
 
C. Local Small Business Enterprise (LSBE) Preference Program 
 

CDS Services Inc., DBA Legion Pest Management, a non-LSBE Prime, did not meet 
the LSBE Preference Program requirements and is not eligible for LSBE preference.  

 
D. Living Wage and Service Contract Worker Retention Policy Applicability 
 

The Living Wage and Service Contract Worker Retention Policy (LW/SCWRP) will 
be applicable on this Contract. Metro staff will monitor and enforce the policy 
guidelines to ensure that workers are paid, at minimum, the current Living Wage rate 
of $25.23 per hour ($19.28 base + $5.95 health benefits), including yearly increases.  
In addition, Contractors will be responsible for submitting the required reports for the 
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LW/SCWRP and other related documentation to staff to determine overall 
compliance with the policy. 
 
LW/SCWRP is applicable on Professional Service Contracts listed below that are 
$25,000.00 or greater and have a contract term of three (3) months or more. The 
LW/SCWRP will apply to professional service contracts for Asphalt and Concrete 
Repair, Facility and Building Maintenance, Food Services, Janitorial and Custodial, 
Landscaping, Laundry Services, Moving Services, Office and Clerical (copier 
maintenance, facsimile maintenance, courier mailing, photographic, printing, 
collections), Parking Lot Management, Pest Control, Security, Street Sweeping, 
Towing, Trash Collection, Tree Trimming, Weed Abatement and Debris Removal; 
and any other Service or labor determined by Metro’s Board of Director, Executive 
Management and DEOD, to meet the intent of this Policy. 
 
DEOD Staff will input current Living Wage hourly rates during the development of 
the Board Report. The policy guidelines are applicable from conception to 
completion of the service contracts, including change order and modification work. 

 

E. Prevailing Wage Applicability 
 
Prevailing Wage is not applicable to this contract. 
 

F. Project Labor Agreement/Construction Careers Policy 
 
Project Labor Agreement/Construction Careers Policy is not applicable to this 
Contract. PLA/CCP is applicable only to construction contracts that have a 
construction related value in excess of $2.5 million.     
 

 
 


